6533 West Pershing Road
Stickney, llinois 60402-4048

Phone - 708-749-4400
Fax - 708-749-4451

Village Trustees
David DeLeshe Martha Gomez James Lazansky
Sam Savopoulos Patrick Sleigher Jeff White

Deborah E. Morelli Kurt Kasnicka Audrey McAdams
Village President Village Treasurer Village Clerk

REGULAR MEETING
BOARD OF TRUSTEES

Tuesday, March 17, 2015

7:00 p.m.
Meeting Agenda
Call to Order
Pledge of Allegiance
Roll Call

Approve Minutes of Previous Regular Meeting
Authorize Payment of Bills
Accept the Report of Illinois Department of Revenue
Accept the Report of Illinois Department of Transportation
Pass and Approve Ordinance 2015-03, “An Ordinance amending Sections 18-101
and 18-102 of Chapter 18 of “Buildings and Building Regulations”
Approve Resolution 08-2015, “A Resolution Authorizing the Execution of a Law
Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement and the Existence and Formation of the
Illinois Law Enforcement Alarm System by Intergovernmental Cooperation”
10. Report from the Mayor
11. Report from Clerk :
12. Trustee Reports/Committee Reports
a. Acceptthe treasurer’s report for the month of December, 2014
13. Reports from Department Heads
14. Audience Questions
15. Adjournment

FHSHRNM e

0

Posted March 12, 2015



March 3, 2015

State of Illinois
County of Cook
Village of Stickney

The Board of Trustees of the Village of Stickney met in regular session on Tuesday,
March 3, 2015 at 7:00 p.m. in the Stickney Village Hall, 6533 W. Pershing Road,
Stickney, Illinois.

Upon the roll call, the following Trustees were present:
Present: Trustees DeLeshe, Gomez, Savopoulos, Sleigher and White
Absent: Trustee Lazansky

Trustee Sleigher moved, duly seconded by Trustee Savopoulos to approve the
minutes of the previous regular board meeting held on February 17, 2015.

Upon the roll call, the following Trustees voted:

Ayes: Trustees DeLeshe, Gomez, Savopoulos, Sleigher and White
Absent: Trustee Lazansky

Nays: None

President Morelli declared the motion carried.

Trustee Gomez moved, duly seconded by Trustee Sleigher that the bills, approved by
the various committees of the Board, be approved for payment, and to approve
warrants which authorize the Village Treasurer to draw checks to pay the bills, to be
signed by the authorized signers, as provided for by the Ordinances of the Village of
Stickney.

Upon the roll call, the following Trustees voted:

Ayes: Trustees DeLeshe, Gomez, Savopoulos, Sleigher and White
Absent: Trustee Lazansky

Nays: None

President Morelli declared the motion carried.

Trustee Sleigher moved, duly seconded by Trustee White to pass and approve
Ordinance 2015-02, “An Ordinance Amending the Fire Code.”

Upon the roll call, the following Trustees voted:

Ayes: Trustees DeLeshe, Gomez, Savopoulos, Sleigher and White
Absent: Trustee Lazansky

Nays: None

President Morelli declared the motion carried.

Prior to the vote, Attorney Donald Kreger explained that he issued a corrected copy
of the ordinance to correct some typing errors.



Page 2

Trustee Sleigher moved, duly seconded by Trustee Savopoulos to approve Resolution
07-2015, “A Resolution Urging the Governor and General Assembly to Protect Full
Funding of Local Government Distributive Fund Revenues”

Upon the roll call, the following Trustees voted:

Ayes: Trustees DeLeshe, Gomez, Savopoulos, Sleigher and White
Absent: Trustee Lazansky

Nays: None

President Morelli declared the motion carried.

Trustee Gomez moved, duly seconded by Trustee White to grant permission to
Misericordia to Conduct their Jelly Belly Candy Days Fundraiser Event on April 24 &
25.

Upon the roll call, the following Trustees voted:

Ayes: Trustees DeLeshe, Gomez, Savopoulos, Sleigher and White
Absent: Trustee Lazansky

Nays: None

President Morelli declared the motion carried.

MAYOR’S REPORT: Trustee Lazansky asked the mayor to explain that the reason he
was not at this meeting was that he had rotary cuff surgery on his shoulder. She
reminded everyone that this Saturday, March 7, 2015 at 11:00 a.m. to 1:00 at the
Stickney/Forest View Library, they will be conducting the St. Baldrick’s Event to
shave heads for charity. Police Chief John Sladetz will be the celebrity having his
head shaved. An invitation was extended to all.

The mayor then proceeded to announce the following: “Recently I had submitted to
the Board of Trustees the appointments of seven people to fill out the Parks and
Recreation Committee Commission. “ “Based on the Board's failure to take any action
to approve the appointments, I am assuming that the commission will not be
operating during the near future, therefore, I have decided to select the same people
to act as Parks and Recreation advisors for me, with the hope that they will help to
review, supervise and approve the Parks and Recreation for the Village of Stickney.”
“] am not seeking the approval of the Village Board for any of my selections here
today.” “I would like to once again have those that are here today, because you have
been here four different times already, Mike Salzar couldn’t be here today, Mark
Kusper would you please stand up.” At this point Trustee White interjected that this
was not on the agenda. Mayor Morelli said, “No, this is under my report and I am not
needing your approval.” Trustee White then said, “Can I say something please?”
“This Board has no intention of not giving you your Parks and Recs committee.” “This
Board has a problem with you appointing three of your political candidates six weeks
before an election.” “If you wanted to remove them from your picks, you would have
had your Parks and Rec Board already, but you chose not to do that.” Mayor Morelli
responded, “I didn’t hear anything mentioned about any of that.” Trustee White
answered, “You're the only one that doesn’t know.” “It seems like everybody else
knew.” Mayor Morelli said, “None of my board knew that.” Trustee White added, “It is



Page 3

just unethical six weeks before an election.” Mayor Morelli went on to say, “These are
people who have been helping me.” Trustee Savopoulos injected this comment,
“These are people who will have to resign because they can’t sit on that board.”
Mayor Morelli answered, “That’s fine, ] need somebody to help now because you've
been on the Board and you've done nothing.” Trustee Savopoulos stated, “I have done
nothing?” Mayor Morelli answered, “Yes, you haven’t. You show up the day of
something.” Trustee Savopoulos remarked, “Really, you know what, we tried to fix
the curb out in front here and you........... ““Mayor Morelli responded, “Right, and we’ll
take care of all of that.” “I am not talking about curbs right now Sam.” “I am talking
about my people.” Trustee Savopoulos went on, “Right now you are sabotaging
yourself, so don't blame me.” Mayor Morelli responded, “No, I'm not sabotaging
anybody.” Trustee White added, “We’re not talking about the budget right now
either.” “But, I tell you what, I wish you would have wanted to put 20% of you effort
towards that budget when we wanted to change it as the effort you are putting
towards the Parks and Rec committee, an Advisory Committee, an Advisory
Committee.” Mayor Morelli announced, “ I have nothing more to say to you.” Trustee
Savopoulos said, “You had nothing to say about the budget.” Mayor Morelli finally
said, “That is fine.” “I'm not talking about the budget.” She went on to announce her
committee, Mark, Maryann Schimmel is not here, Sheri Young, Ed Dabrowski he’s not
here, Darrio Ramirez is not here and Magan Carpenter. Thank you very much for
being here tonight and I'm looking forward to working with all of you.

CLERK'’S REPORT: The clerk provided information she received on an EPA permit
request application for Waste Management Metro located at 3815 S. Laramie. The
description of the project stated: Update Closure Plan and Closure Cost Estimate to
reflect currently permitted operations. Public Works Supervisor Jeff Boyajian
mentioned that he placed a phone call to the EPA for an explanation of the project. He
is waiting for them to call him back. In addition, the Clerk gave information
concerning a School District 103 candidate’s forum on March 10, 2015 at George
Washington Middle School at 7:00 p.m. facilitated by the League of Women Voters.

TRUSTEE’S REPORTS: Trustee Gomez gave the Fire Department report for the month
of February, 2015 there were: Ambulance calls; 51: Mutual Aid Calls; 14: Service
Calls; 5: Fire Calls; 10: Hazardous Condition Calls; 2: Motor Vehicle Accidents; 5:
Working Fires; 1: Brush/Trash Fire Calls; 0: Car Fires; 1: Total calls for the month of
January: 89; Total calls for 2015: 181

Trustee Gomez moved, duly seconded by Trustee Savopoulos to accept the
treasurer’s report for the month of November, 2014.

Upon the roll call, the following Trustees voted:

Ayes: Trustees DeLeshe, Gomez, Savopoulos, Sleigher and White
Absent: Trustee Lazansky

Nays: None

President Morelli declared the motion carried.

There was a comment made from audience member Mark Kusper who said that it
wasn’t a surprise that Trustee White had no report. In response, Trustee White



Page 4

answered, “When you are not on any committees there is nothing to report on.”
“When you are removed from everything, there is nothing to report on.”

DEPARTMENT REPORTS: Fire Chief Larry Meyer reminded people that on Saturday,
they should move their clocks up. The fire department purchased some ice cleats to
prevent falls on ice during large fires. He mentioned that firefighters have fallen on
ice during large fires. March is Severe Weather Awareness Month. Be aware and be
prepared. We were also told about an accident involving our hook and ladder truck.
The fire alarm went off at 1:30 in the morning at Koppers Industries. The ladder
truck was responding when it was hit. No one was hurt. The other driver was
operating his vehicle on a revoked driver’s license. There is a possibility that our
insurance company may have to bite the bullet on this one. The$15,000 in repairs
includes the front door and fender, it took out the site glass from the bearing axle oil,
and there were pieces of the guy’s car imbedded between the tire and the wheel.
Thursday morning the truck is going to a specialty repair shop in St. Johns, Indiana. It
will probably be out of service for two weeks. He was glad no one was hurt including
the guy driving the car.

There being no further business, Trustee Gomez moved, duly seconded by Trustee
Sleigher that the meeting be adjourned. Upon which the Board adopted the motion at
7:15 p.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Audrey McAdams, Village Clerk

Approved by me this day of , 2015

Deborah E. Morelli, Village Mayor



Vendor Inquiry - Warrant Details Page 1 of 1

STICKNEY VILLAGE
i wendor TREASURER "@ ‘@ @

Summary Contracts Payments

Vendor Home

Warrant/EFT#: EF 0005608

Fiscal Year: 2015 Issue Date: 03/09/15
Warrant Total:  $43,925.25 Warrant Status:
Agency Contract Invoice Voucher Agency Amount
492 - REVENUE AG768008 5SAG768008 $43,925.25

IOC Accounting Line Details

Fund Agency Organization Appropriation Object Amount Appropriation Name

0189 492 27 44510055 4491 $43,925.25 DISTRIBUTE MUNI/CNTY SALES TA?(

Payment Voucher Description

Line Text

| 1 1L DEPT. OF REVENUE AUTHORIZED THIS PAYMENT ON 03/07/2015
2 MUNICIPAL 1 % SHARE OF SALES TAX

3 LIAB MO: DEC. 2014 COLL MO: JAN. 2015 VCHR MO: MAR. 2015

4 7'S PHONE: 217 785-6518 EMAIL: REV.LOCALTAX@ILLINOIS.GOV

61 MUNICIPAL 1 % SHARE OF SALES TAX

Click here for assistance with this screen.

S ALES JAX
Fonr DgCE/\/LB{?TZ) 2.0 |4

$43,925.25

https://www.whl.ioc.state.il.us/Vendor/VendWarrDetl.cfm?Warrant=0005608%20%20%2... 3/11/2015



Vendor Inquiry - Warrant Details Page 1 of 1

Vend STICKNEY VILLAGE 4
endor TREASURER OF 5

Warrants

Summary Contracts Payments

Vender Home

Warrant/EFT#: EF 0002793
Fiscal Year: 2015 Issue Date: 03/04/15
Warrant Total: $12,191.11 Warrant Status:
Agency Contract Invoice Voucher Agency Amount
494 - TRANSPORTATION 5MT003887 $12,191.11

IOC Accounting Line Details

Fund Agency Organization Appropriation Object Amount Appropriation Name
0414 494 90 44910000 4491 $12,191.11 DISTRB ITEMS: MUNICIPALITIES

Agency Contact Information

217-782-6496

Click here for assistance with this screen.

M oTor + uel TAX
FoRr. T EBRUARY O 5

$(2.,191.1]

https://www.whl.ioc.state.il.us/Vendor/Vend WarrDetl.cfm?Warrant=0002793%20%20%20... 3/5/2015



THE VILLAGE OF STICKNEY

Cook County, lllinois

ORDINANCE NO. 2015-03

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS 18-101 AND
18-102 OF CHAPTER 18 ENTITLED “BUILDINGS AND
BUILDING REGULATIONS” OF THE MUNICIPAL
CODE OF THE VILLAGE OF STICKNEY
(ADOPTION OF THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE)

Published in pamphlet form by authority of the President and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Stickney this day of , 2015.

Passed by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Stickney this
day of , 2015.




ORDINANCE NO. 2015-03

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS 18-101 AND
18-102 OF CHAPTER 18 ENTITLED “BUILDINGS AND
BUILDING REGULATIONS” OF THE MUNICIPAL
CODE OF THE VILLAGE OF STICKNEY
(ADOPTION OF THE 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE)

BE IT ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Stickney, Cook
County, lllinois as follows:

Section 1. Section 18-101, “Adopted,” of Article 1 entitled “Building Code” of Chapter 18
entitled “Buildings and Building Regulations” be and the same is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 18-101 Adoption of Building Code. There is hereby adopted by reference, as if fully
set out at length in this section, that publication known and designated as the

International Building Code, 2009 Edition, including Appendix Chapters C, E, F, G, H, l and J,
as published by the International Code Council as the Building Code of the Village of Stickney,
lllinois, regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings

and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical
things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation
and use; and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use
and the demolition of such structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits;
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Building
Code, three copies of which are on file in the office of the Village Clerk with the following
additions, insertions and deletions and changes to the Building Code set forth in Section
18-102 of this Chapter 18.

Section 2. Section 18-102 “Definition “ of article Il entitled “Building Code” of Chapter 18
entitled Buildings and Building Regulations be and the same is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Section 18-102. Additions, insertions, deletions and changes:

A. Whenever the term Name of Jurisdiction is used, it shall mean the Village of
Stickney.
B. References to the establishment and duties and authority of the Board of Appeals

shall not be effective and shall be deleted.

C. The following sections or subsections of the Building Code are revised, deleted or
added as indicated:



902.1 definition of Fire Area is hereby revised to read as follows:
The aggregate floor area bounded by the exterior walls of a building:
regardless of fire walls, fire barriers, or fire resistance rate horizontal
assemblies.

903.2 is hereby revised to read:
903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new
buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described in
903.2.1 through 903.2.12 as amended.

Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in existing buildings
and structures when any of the following conditions exist:

1. A change of use occurs and the new use would require an automatic
sprinkler system if it were a new building or structure.

2, When an addition is made to the building or structure resulting in or
enlarging a fire area that would necessitate an automatic sprinkler
system if it were a new building or structure.

3 When the building or structure receives alterations or improvements
valued at or costing 50% or more of the replacement cost of the existing
building or structure; or when 50% or more of the existing building or
structure is being altered or improved.

903.2.1.1 item 1 is hereby revised to read:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

903.2.1.3 item 1 is hereby revised to read:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

903.2.1.4 item 1 is hereby revised to read:

1. The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

903.2.3 Group E item 1 is hereby revised to read:

1« Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 5,000 square feet in area.

903.2.4 is hereby revised to read:

903.2.4 Group F-1 and F-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be

provided throughout all buildings containing a Group F-1 or Group F-2
occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

2



1. A Group F-1 or F-2 fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

2. A Group F-1 or F-2 fire area is located more than three stories
above grade plane.

3. Deleted.
903.2.7 Group M, Item 1 is hereby revised to read:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.
903.2.7 Group M is further revised by deleting ltem 3.

903.2.9 Group S-1 is hereby revised to read:

903.2.9 Groups S-1 and S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings containing a Group 5-1 or 5-2 occupancy where one
of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group S-1 or S-2 fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

2. A Group S-1 or S-2 fire area is located more than three stories
above grade plane.

3. Deleted.
903.2.9.1 items 1 and 2 are hereby revised to read:

1. Buildings having two or more stories above grade plane, including
basements with a fire area containing a repair garage exceeding
5,000 square feet.

2. Buildings no more than one story above grade plane, with a fire
area containing a repair garage exceeding 5,000 square feet.

903.2.10 Group S-2 enclosed parking garage item 1 is hereby revised to read.

1, Where the fire area of the enclosed parking garage exceeds 5,000
square feet.

903.3.5 Water Supplies is hereby revised to read:

903.3.5 Water Supplies. Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems

shall comply with this section and the standards referenced in 903.3.1.

The potable water supply shall be protected against backflow in accordance
with the requirements of this section and the Plumbing Code applicable to the
Village of Stickney. Hydrant water flow data used for any sprinkler system
shall be no more than one (1) year old.

S



The following subsection is hereby added:

903.3.8 Groups S and F speculative buildings and structures with ceilings

of 25 feet or more. Where a building or structure of Use Group S or F with a
ceiling height of 25 feet or more is proposed and no specific tenant is known, an
ESFR sprinkler system designed for Class IV commodities stored on racks to the
greatest possible storage height shall be provided.

The initial paragraph of 903.4.1 is hereby revised to read:

903.4.1 Monitoring. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly
different and shall be automatically transmitted directly to the Stickney Fire
Department Communications Center.

The following subsections are hereby added:

903.4.2.1 Outside Devices. Provide an outside audible horn or bell visual
(75 cd clear strobe) device over the fire department connection.

903.4.2.2. Occupant notification. All sprinklered buildings shall be provided
with occupant notification appliances.

903.4.2.3. Access to test valves. Fire sprinkling system inspectors test valves
shall be accessible at all times and located no more than six (6) feet above the
finished floor. On multiple riser systems test valves shall be marked as to which
riser and area it tests.

903.4.3. Floor Control Valves is hereby revised to read:

903.4.3. Floor Control Valves. Approved supervised indicating control
valves shall be provided at the point of connection to the riser on each
floor in multiple story buildings. Provide floor control valves with water
flow switches for each floor.

The following sections and subsections are hereby added:

903.4.4. Automatic Sprinklers. Where automatic sprinklers provide
protection to an area with an approved flow switch interconnected to

the fire alarm system, and the area is easily identifiable as to the

location of the activation, additional automatic detectors are not required.
When a building has numerous rooms protected by a zoned sprinkler system,
additional smoke detectors shall be required to provide a more rapid means
to identify the location of a fire.

903.3.5.3. Minimum Safety Factor. Provide a minimum 10% or 5 psi
minimum safety factor, and the system demand shall be 5 psi minimum above
the season low water flow test supply.

903.7. Hydraulic Name Plate. By each hydraulically calculated area, on
each drawing provide a copy of the hydraulic name plate.



903.9. Fire Pump Test Header. Provide an outside test header on fire pump
installations.

903.10. Private Fire Hydrants. Fire hydrants shall be provided around the
perimeter of the building in 300 feet increments. A fire hydrant shall be located
within 100 feet of the fire department connection on the fire protection water
supply to the building. Fire flow requirements are subject to the provisions of
Appendix B of the International Fire Code, 2009 Edition.

903.11. Outdoor Access. Provide an outdoor access to the sprinkler riser valve
room and fire pump room.

903.12. Minimum separation of sprinkler valve room. Provide a minimum one(1)
hour separation of sprinkler valve room.

903.13. Warehouse Storage Areas. In all storage areas exceeding 20,000
square feet and in all storage areas exceeding 12 feet in height, provide inside

2 ¥ inch fire hose valves with 1 %z inch reducer to a 1 %2 inch connection.

Locate the valve at each door entrance to the warehouse and/or storage area.
Provide additional 2 % inch fire hose valves so that no portion of the warehouse
and/or storage area is more than 120 feet maximum travel distance to a fire hose
valve. Show the locations of all obstructions and/or racks on the drawing.

The fire hose valves system pipings shall be:
1. A separate riser piping system.

2. The 2 Y inch valves shall be supplied by a minimum of 4 inch
with 2 % inch drops to each valve.

3. Where system pressures exceed 100 psi, provide reduced
pressure field adjustable type valves.

907.1.4. Fire Alarm System. A fire alarm system shall be of the addressable
type except when monitoring a single sprinkler riser and control valves.

The initial paragraph of 907.2. is hereby revised to read:

907.2. Where required — New Buildings and Structures. An approved

fire alarm system installed in accordance with the provisions of this Code and
NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings and structures in accordance

with 907.2.1 through 907.2.24, and provide occupant notification in accordance
with 907.6, unless other requirements are provided by other sections of this
Code.

The following subsections are hereby added:

907.2.7.2. Multi-Tenant use. Multi-Tenant Use Group M Buildings
will be “ring by tenant” activated by the fire sprinkler system flow switch

-5-



for that space of automatic fire detection and shall include a weatherproof
clear outside strobe over the entrance to each tenant space as directed
by the fire department. All outside strobes shall be 75 candela minimum.

907.2.24. Unsprinkled Buildings and Structures. An approved automatic alarm
system shall be installed in all use groups not provided with an automatic
sprinkler system. Automatic smoke detection shall be used except where
ambient conditions would result in nuisance alarm conditions.

907.7.3.1. is hereby revised by adding the following:
All fire alarm control panels or full function annunciator panels shall be
installed within ten (10) feet of the main entrance, or in locations approved
by the fire department.

The following subsection is hereby added:

912.1.1. Fire department connections. All fire department connections
shall be 4 inch story connections with 30 degree down turn.

1006.3 is hereby revised to add item 6 to read:

6. All rooms containing building fire sprinkler riser(s), fire pump)s) and
fire control panel(s).

Section 2. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its
passage, approval and publication in pamphlet form as provided by law.

Passed this day of , 2015,
AYES:
NAYS:
ABSENT:
ABSENTIONS:
APPROVED by me this day of , 20185,

Deborah Morelli, President

ATTESTED and FILED in my office
this day of , 2015.

Audrey McAdams, Village Clerk



Municipality of Stickney
State of lllinois

Resolution No. 08-2015

A Resolution Authorizing the Execution of a Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement and the
Existence and Formation of the lllinois Law Enforcement Alarm System by Intergovernmental
Cooperation.

Whereas the Municipality of Stickney, of the State of lllinois (hereinafter “Municipality”) is a
Municipality of the State of lllinois and duly constituted public agency of the State of lllinois, and;

Whereas the Municipality, as a public agency of the State of lllinois, is authorized and
empowered by the Constitution of the State of lllinois (lll. Const. Art. VII, § 10) and the lllinois
Intergovernmental Cooperation Act (5 ILCS 220/1 et seq.) to enter into intergovernmental agreements
with other public agencies on matters of mutual concern and interest such as the provision of
adequate law enforcement personnel and resources for the protection of residents and property
falling within the jurisdiction of the Municipality, and;

Whereas the Municipality recognizes that certain natural or man-made occurrences may result
in emergencies or disasters that exceed the resources, equipment and/or law enforcement personnel
of a single given public agency, and;

Whereas, a given public agency can, by entering into a mutual aid agreement for law
enforcement services and resources, effectively provide a broader range and more plentiful amount
of law enforcement capability for the citizenry which it serves, and;

Whereas, in order to have an effective mutual aid agreement for law enforcement resources
and services, this Municipality recognizes it must be prepared to come to the aid of other public
agencies in their respective times of need due to emergencies or disasters, and,;

Whereas, this Municipality recognizes the need for our specific Municipality to develop an
effective mutual aid agreement for law enforcement services and resources upon which it may call
upon in its time of need and is prepared to enter into a mutual aid agreement for law enforcement
services and resources with other like-minded public agencies, and;

Whereas, this Municipality also recognizes the need for the existence of a public agency,
formed by an intergovernmental agreement between two or more public agencies, which can serve to
coordinate and facilitate the provision of law enforcement mutual aid between signatory public
agencies to a mutual aid agreement for law enforcement services and resources, and;

Whereas, this Municipality has been provided with a certain “Law Enforcement Mutual Aid
Agreement” which has been reviewed by the elected officials of this Municipality and which other
public agencies in the State of lllinois are prepared to execute, in conjunction with this Municipality, in
order to provide and receive law enforcement mutual aid services as set forth in the “Law
Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement,” and;

Whereas, it is the anticipation and intention of this Municipality that this “Law Enforcement
Mutual Aid Agreement” will be executed in counterparts as other public agencies choose to enter into
the “Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement” and strengthen the number of signatory public
agencies and resources available from those public agencies, and;

Whereas, it is the anticipation and intent of this Municipality that the “Law Enforcement Mutual
Aid Agreement” will continue to garner support and acceptance from other currently unidentified
public agencies who will enter into the “Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement” over time and be



considered as if all signatory public agencies to the “Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement” had
executed the “Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement” at the same time,

Now, therefore, be it resolved by this Municipality/County as follows:

s This Resolution shall be known as, and may hereafter be referred to as, the Resolution
Authorizing the Execution of a Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement and the Existence and
Formation of the Illinois Law Enforcement Alarm System by Intergovernmental Cooperation.

2. The Resolution Authorizing the Execution of a Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement
and the Existence and Formation of the lllinois Law Enforcement Alarm System by Intergovernmental
Cooperation shall be, and hereby is, enacted as follows:

a. Authorization to enter into a Certain Agreement. The Mayor of this Municipality is
hereby authorized to sign, execute and deliver the agreement known as the “Law
Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement” and thereby enter into an intergovernmental
agreement with such other public agencies of the State of lllinois as are likewise willing
to enter into said “Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement” and recognize the
existence and formation of the lllinois Law Enforcement Alarm System as set forth in the
said “Law Enforcement Mutual Aid Agreement.”

b. Savings Clause. If any section, paragraph, clause or provision of this Resolution shall
be held invalid, the invalidity thereof shall not affect any of the provisions of this
Resolution.

c. Effective Date. This Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage, approval and publication as provided by law.
Passed this 17th day of March, 2015.
Ayes:
Nays:
Absent:
Abstain:

Approved this 17th day of March, 2015.

President/Mayor/County Board Chairman, etc

Attest:

Municipality/County Clerk etc



